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Bible

Genesis 27:1-15, 18-24, 30-35, 41-45 (to 1st :)
And it came to pass, that when Isaac was old, and his eyes were dim, so that he could not see, 
he called Esau his eldest son, and said unto him, My son: and he said unto him, Behold, here 
am I.

And he said, Behold now, I am old, I know not the day of my death:

Now therefore take, I pray thee, thy weapons, thy quiver and thy bow, and go out to the field, 
and take me some venison;

And make me savoury meat, such as I love, and bring it to me, that I may eat; that my soul may 
bless thee before I die.

And Rebekah heard when Isaac spake to Esau his son. And Esau went to the field to hunt for 
venison, and to bring it.

And Rebekah spake unto Jacob her son, saying, Behold, I heard thy father speak unto Esau thy 
brother, saying,

Bring me venison, and make me savoury meat, that I may eat, and bless thee before the Lord 
before my death.

Now therefore, my son, obey my voice according to that which I command thee.

Go now to the flock, and fetch me from thence two good kids of the goats; and I will make them 
savoury meat for thy father, such as he loveth:

And thou shalt bring it to thy father, that he may eat, and that he may bless thee before his 
death.

And Jacob said to Rebekah his mother, Behold, Esau my brother is a hairy man, and I am a 
smooth man:

My father peradventure will feel me, and I shall seem to him as a deceiver; and I shall bring a 
curse upon me, and not a blessing.

And his mother said unto him, Upon me be thy curse, my son: only obey my voice, and go fetch 
me them.



And he went, and fetched, and brought them to his mother: and his mother made savoury meat, 
such as his father loved.

And Rebekah took goodly raiment of her eldest son Esau, which were with her in the house, 
and put them upon Jacob her younger son:

And he came unto his father, and said, My father: and he said, Here am I; who art thou, my 
son?

And Jacob said unto his father, I am Esau thy firstborn; I have done according as thou badest 
me: arise, I pray thee, sit and eat of my venison, that thy soul may bless me.

And Isaac said unto his son, How is it that thou hast found it so quickly, my son? And he said, 
Because the Lord thy God brought it to me.

And Isaac said unto Jacob, Come near, I pray thee, that I may feel thee, my son, whether thou 
be my very son Esau or not.

And Jacob went near unto Isaac his father; and he felt him, and said, The voice is Jacob’s voice, 
but the hands are the hands of Esau.

And he discerned him not, because his hands were hairy, as his brother Esau’s hands: so he 
blessed him.

And he said, Art thou my very son Esau? And he said, I am.

And it came to pass, as soon as Isaac had made an end of blessing Jacob, and Jacob was yet 
scarce gone out from the presence of Isaac his father, that Esau his brother came in from his 
hunting.

And he also had made savoury meat, and brought it unto his father, and said unto his father, Let 
my father arise, and eat of his son’s venison, that thy soul may bless me.

And Isaac his father said unto him, Who art thou? And he said, I am thy son, thy firstborn Esau.

And Isaac trembled very exceedingly, and said, Who? where is he that hath taken venison, and 
brought it me, and I have eaten of all before thou camest, and have blessed him? yea, and he 
shall be blessed.

And when Esau heard the words of his father, he cried with a great and exceeding bitter cry, and 
said unto his father, Bless me, even me also, O my father.

And he said, Thy brother came with subtilty, and hath taken away thy blessing.

And Esau hated Jacob because of the blessing wherewith his father blessed him: and Esau said 
in his heart, The days of mourning for my father are at hand; then will I slay my brother Jacob.



And these words of Esau her elder son were told to Rebekah: and she sent and called Jacob 
her younger son, and said unto him, Behold, thy brother Esau, as touching thee, doth comfort 
himself, purposing to kill thee.

Now therefore, my son, obey my voice; and arise, flee thou to Laban my brother to Haran;

And tarry with him a few days, until thy brother’s fury turn away:

Until thy brother’s anger turn away from thee, and he forget that which thou hast done to him:

Genesis 32:1, 3-18 Jacob, 21, 24-30
And Jacob went on his way, and the angels of God met him.

Jacob sent messengers before him to Esau his brother unto the land of Seir, the country of 
Edom.

And he commanded them, saying, Thus shall ye speak unto my lord Esau; Thy servant Jacob 
saith thus, I have sojourned with Laban, and stayed there until now:

And I have oxen, and asses, flocks, and menservants, and womenservants: and I have sent to 
tell my lord, that I may find grace in thy sight.

And the messengers returned to Jacob, saying, We came to thy brother Esau, and also he 
cometh to meet thee, and four hundred men with him.

Then Jacob was greatly afraid and distressed: and he divided the people that was with him, and 
the flocks, and herds, and the camels, into two bands;

And said, If Esau come to the one company, and smite it, then the other company which is left 
shall escape.

And Jacob said, O God of my father Abraham, and God of my father Isaac, the Lord which 
saidst unto me, Return unto thy country, and to thy kindred, and I will deal well with thee:

I am not worthy of the least of all the mercies, and of all the truth, which thou hast shewed unto 
thy servant; for with my staff I passed over this Jordan; and now I am become two bands.

Deliver me, I pray thee, from the hand of my brother, from the hand of Esau: for I fear him, lest 
he will come and smite me, and the mother with the children.

And thou saidst, I will surely do thee good, and make thy seed as the sand of the sea, which 
cannot be numbered for multitude.

And he lodged there that same night; and took of that which came to his hand a present for 
Esau his brother;

Two hundred she goats, and twenty he goats, two hundred ewes, and twenty rams,

Thirty milch camels with their colts, forty kine, and ten bulls, twenty she asses, and ten foals.



And he delivered them into the hand of his servants, every drove by themselves; and said unto 
his servants, Pass over before me, and put a space betwixt drove and drove.

And he commanded the foremost, saying, When Esau my brother meeteth thee, and asketh 
thee, saying, Whose art thou? and whither goest thou? and whose are these before thee?

Then thou shalt say, They be thy servant Jacob’s; it is a present sent unto my lord Esau: and, 
behold, also he is behind us.

So went the present over before him: and himself lodged that night in the company.

And Jacob was left alone; and there wrestled a man with him until the breaking of the day.

And when he saw that he prevailed not against him, he touched the hollow of his thigh; and the 
hollow of Jacob’s thigh was out of joint, as he wrestled with him.

And he said, Let me go, for the day breaketh. And he said, I will not let thee go, except thou 
bless me.

And he said unto him, What is thy name? And he said, Jacob.

And he said, Thy name shall be called no more Jacob, but Israel: for as a prince hast thou 
power with God and with men, and hast prevailed.

And Jacob asked him, and said, Tell me, I pray thee, thy name. And he said, Wherefore is it that 
thou dost ask after my name? And he blessed him there.

And Jacob called the name of the place Peniel: for I have seen God face to face, and my life is 
preserved.

Genesis 33:1-4, 11
And Jacob lifted up his eyes, and looked, and, behold, Esau came, and with him four hundred 
men. And he divided the children unto Leah, and unto Rachel, and unto the two handmaids.

And he put the handmaids and their children foremost, and Leah and her children after, and 
Rachel and Joseph hindermost.

And he passed over before them, and bowed himself to the ground seven times, until he came 
near to his brother.

And Esau ran to meet him, and embraced him, and fell on his neck, and kissed him: and they 
wept. 

Take, I pray thee, my blessing that is brought to thee; because God hath dealt graciously with 
me, and because I have enough. And he urged him, and he took it.



I Kings 17:1
And Elijah the Tishbite, who was of the inhabitants of Gilead, said unto Ahab, As the Lord God 
of Israel liveth, before whom I stand, there shall not be dew nor rain these years, but according 
to my word.

I Kings18:46 1st the (to ;)
the hand of the Lord was on Elijah;  

I Kings 19:1-8  Ahab
Ahab told Jezebel all that Elijah had done, and withal how he had slain all the prophets with the 
sword.

Then Jezebel sent a messenger unto Elijah, saying, So let the gods do to me, and more also, if I 
make not thy life as the life of one of them by to-morrow about this time.

And when he saw that, he arose, and went for his life, and came to Beer–sheba, which 
belongeth to Judah, and left his servant there.

But he himself went a day’s journey into the wilderness, and came and sat down under a juniper 
tree: and he requested for himself that he might die; and said, It is enough; now, O Lord, take 
away my life; for I am not better than my fathers.

And as he lay and slept under a juniper tree, behold, then an angel touched him, and said unto 
him, Arise and eat.

And he looked, and, behold, there was a cake baken on the coals, and a cruse of water at his 
head. And he did eat and drink, and laid him down again.

And the angel of the Lord came again the second time, and touched him, and said, Arise and 
eat; because the journey is too great for thee.

And he arose, and did eat and drink, and went in the strength of that meat forty days and forty 
nights unto Horeb the mount of God.
 
Psalms 42:11
Why art thou cast down, O my soul? and why art thou disquieted within me? hope thou in God: 
for I shall yet praise him, who is the health of my countenance, and my God.
 
Psalms 118:1, 8, 14, 16-17
O give thanks unto the Lord; for he is good: because his mercy endureth for ever.

It is better to trust in the Lord than to put confidence in man.

The Lord is my strength and song, and is become my salvation.

The right hand of the Lord is exalted: the right hand of the Lord doeth valiantly.

I shall not die, but live, and declare the works of the Lord.



Psalms 46:1-3 (to 1st.), 5, 7 (to .), 10-11 (to 1st.)
God is our refuge and strength, a very present help in trouble.

Therefore will not we fear, though the earth be removed, and though the mountains be carried 
into the midst of the sea;

Though the waters thereof roar and be troubled, though the mountains shake with the swelling 
thereof.

God is in the midst of her; she shall not be moved: God shall help her, and that right early.

The Lord of hosts is with us; the God of Jacob is our refuge.

Be still, and know that I am God: I will be exalted among the heathen, I will be exalted in the 
earth.

The Lord of hosts is with us; the God of Jacob is our refuge.

Science and Health with Key to the Scriptures by Mary Baker Eddy

308:16-23 (np)
Jacob was alone, wrestling with error, — struggling with a mortal sense of life, substance, and 
intelligence as existent in matter with its false pleasures and pains, — when an angel, a 
message from Truth and Love, appeared to him and smote the sinew, or strength, of his error, 
till he saw its unreality; and Truth, being thereby understood, gave him spiritual strength in this 
Peniel of divine Science. Then said the spiritual evangel: “Let me go, for the day breaketh;” that 
is, the light of Truth and Love dawns upon thee. But the patriarch, perceiving his error and his 
need of help, did not loosen his hold upon this glorious light until his nature was transformed. 
When Jacob was asked, “What is thy name?” he straightway answered; and then his name was 
changed to Israel, for “as a prince” had he prevailed and had “power with God and with men.” 
Then Jacob questioned his deliverer, “Tell me, I pray thee, thy name;” but this appellation was 
withheld, for the messenger was not a corporeal being, but a nameless, incorporeal impartation 
of divine Love to man, which, to use the word of the Psalmist, restored his Soul, — gave him the 
spiritual sense of being and rebuked his material sense.

The result of Jacob’s struggle thus appeared. He had conquered material error with the 
understanding of Spirit and of spiritual power. This changed the man. He was no longer called 
Jacob, but Israel, — a prince of God, or a soldier of God, who had fought a good fight. He was 
to become the father of those, who through earnest striving followed his demonstration of the 
power of Spirit over the material senses; and the children of earth who followed his example 
were to be called the children of Israel, until the Messiah should rename them. If these children 
should go astray, and forget that Life is God, good, and that good is not in elements which are 
not spiritual, — thus losing the divine power which heals the sick and sinning, — they were to be 
brought back through great tribulation, to be renamed in Christian Science and led to deny 
material sense, or mind in matter, even as the gospel teaches.

171:4
Through discernment of the spiritual opposite of materiality, even the way through Christ, Truth, 
man will reopen with the key of divine Science the gates of Paradise which human beliefs have 



closed, and will find himself unfallen, upright, pure, and free, not needing to consult almanacs 
for the probabilities either of his life or of the weather, not needing to study brainology to learn 
how much of a man he is.

322:26
 The sharp experiences of belief in the supposititious life of matter, as well as our 
disappointments and ceaseless woes, turn us like tired children to the arms of divine Love. Then 
we begin to learn Life in divine Science. Without this process of weaning, “Canst thou by 
searching find out God?” It is easier to desire Truth than to rid one’s self of error. Mortals may 
seek the understanding of Christian Science, but they will not be able to glean from Christian 
Science the facts of being without striving for them. This strife consists in the endeavor to 
forsake error of every kind and to possess no other consciousness but good.

254:2-8, 10-12
. Individuals are consistent who, watching and praying, can “run, and not be weary; . . . walk, 
and not faint,” who gain good rapidly and hold their position, or attain slowly and yield not to 
discouragement. God requires perfection, but not until the battle between Spirit and flesh is 
fought and the victory won.  

When we wait patiently on God and seek Truth righteously, He directs our path.

14:12-18
Become conscious for a single moment that Life and intelligence are purely spiritual, — neither 
in nor of matter, — and the body will then utter no complaints. If suffering from a belief in 
sickness, you will find yourself suddenly well. Sorrow is turned into joy when the body is 
controlled by spiritual Life, Truth, and Love.

22:11
“Work out your own salvation,” is the demand of Life and Love, for to this end God worketh with 
you. “Occupy till I come!” Wait for your reward, and “be not weary in well doing.” If your 
endeavors are beset by fearful odds, and you receive no present reward, go not back to error, 
nor become a sluggard in the race.

304:9
This is the doctrine of Christian Science: that divine Love cannot be deprived of its 
manifestation, or object; that joy cannot be turned into sorrow, for sorrow is not the master of 
joy; that good can never produce evil; that matter can never produce mind nor life result in 
death. The perfect man — governed by God, his perfect Principle — is sinless and eternal.

76:22-26
The sinless joy, — the perfect harmony and immortality of Life, possessing unlimited divine 
beauty and goodness without a single bodily pleasure or pain, — constitutes the only veritable, 
indestructible man, whose being is spiritual.

329:17
To be discouraged, is to resemble a pupil in addition, who attempts to solve a problem of Euclid, 
and denies the rule of the problem because he fails in his first effort.



129:5
Truth is ever truthful, and can tolerate no error in premise or conclusion.

442:30 
Christian Scientists, be a law to yourselves that mental malpractice cannot harm you either 
when asleep or when awake.

From Concord Express - A Christian Science Study Resource: The King James Version of the Bible and Mary 
Baker Eddy's published writings


